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EIR Request        

 PE\2026\ENQ\53865 EIR - Please may you advise if there are any open planning 

enforcements for properties within your local authority in 
any of the below listed categories, and if so, please may 

you provide the details:  

  
- Enforcement notices  

- Stop notices 
- Listed building enforcement notices  

- Breach of condition notices  

- Planning contravention notices  
- Other notices relating to breach of planning control  

- Listed building repairs notices  
- In the case of a listed building deliberately allowed to fall 

into disrepair, compulsory purchase orders with a direction 
for minimum compensation 

- Building preservation notices   

- Orders revoking or modifying planning permission  
- Orders requiring discontinuance or use of alteration or 

removal of building or works  
- Proceedings to enforce a planning agreement or planning 

contribution  

  
By 'open', we refer to notices which have yet to be 

complied with or 'closed'.  
 

 

13 May 

2026 

13 May 

2026 

10 Jun 2026 YES NO 



RESPONSE: 

13/05/2026 - acknowledgement and response sent. 
 

 PE\2026\ENQ\53798 EIR - Request received via WhatDoTheyKnow.com  

 

Questions re climate change - see full details of request on 
NEC DM. 

 
RESPONSE: 

20/05/2026 - Final response - information provided 

23 Apr 

2026 

20 May 

2026 

20 May 2026 YES NO 

 PE\2026\ENQ\53669 EIR - information in connection with LDC application 

reference NP/DDD/1225/1234  Hillside Stables, Calver. 
 

Request for additional details that do not appear to be 

available on the public portal but are referenced in file 
notes. 

 
See full details of request on NEC DM. 

 
RESPONSE: 

13/04/2026 - Final response, advising that info already 

provided by Legal (Planning Lawyer), sent copies of photos 
taken in 2017. 

24 Mar 

2026 

13 Apr 2026 22 Apr 2026 YES NO 

 PE\2026\ENQ\53924 EIR - I request disclosure of the following recorded 

information held by the Authority:  

 - The complaint, report or other communication that gave 
rise to the opening of case EN26/0008, including: the date 

received; the medium of communication; and any 
attachments, photographs or supporting documents 

submitted with it.  
 - Any recorded information identifying the source of the 

complaint or communication referred to at item 1, including 

the name and contact details of the person, persons or 
organisation that made or submitted it.  

 - All internal correspondence, file notes, case management 

26 May 

2026 

22 Jun 2026 22 Jun 2026 YES NO 



entries and internal communications concerning case 

EN26/0008 from the date of receipt of the complaint to the 
date of this request. 

 - All aerial photographs, satellite imagery or other remote-
sensing imagery relied upon by the Authority in connection 

with case EN26/0008, including: dates of capture; source 
and provider details; and copies of the imagery itself where 

held in a form capable of being supplied.  

 - Any site visit notes, inspection records, photographs or 
other records generated during any visit to the property in 

connection with case EN26/0008.  
 - Any communications between the Authority and third 

parties concerning case EN26/0008, excluding 

communications solely between the Authority and the 
Respondents. 

 
The information requested constitutes environmental 

information within the meaning of regulation 2(1) of the 
EIR 2004. If the Authority considers that any of the 

information requested is exempt from disclosure under 

regulations 12 or 13, please: identify each item in respect 
of which an exception is relied upon; specify the particular 

exception relied upon in each case; and set out the public 
interest reasoning required by regulation 12(1)(b), where 

applicable.  

 
RESPONSE: 

22/06/2026 - Final response, some information provided, 
redactions made for third party personal data, Regulation 

13(2A) of UK GDPR - fairness principle. 
 

 PE\2026\ENQ\53962 EIR - I am writing to formally request information under 
the Environmental Information Regulations (EIR) regarding 

the playground installation located on the land opposite the 

Sycamore Inn in Parwich. 
 

04 Jun 
2026 

29 Jun 2026 01 Jul 2026 YES NO 



An enforcement officer, [], has informed me that "no 

breach of planning has occurred." I am formally requesting 
the evidence and legal justification for this conclusion. 

Please provide the following within the statutory 20-
working-day period: 

 
The Officer's Report: A copy of the internal assessment or 

report that led to the conclusion that no breach of planning 

control has occurred. 
 

Legislative Citation: If the Authority maintains that this is 
"Permitted Development," please provide the specific 

legislative citation (e.g., the relevant section of the Town 

and Country Planning (General Permitted Development) 
Order) that authorises the installation of playground 

equipment within two metres of a residential dwelling. 
 

Planning History: Copies of any planning applications, site 
suitability assessments, or noise impact studies conducted 

prior to the installation of this equipment. 

 
Certificate of Lawfulness: Evidence of any Certificate of 

Lawfulness issued for this site. 
 

If any of this information is held by the Parish Council, 

please note that under the EIR, the National Park Authority 
is responsible for ensuring the information is disclosed or 

for directing me to the correct source. 
 

I look forward to receiving this information by the end of 
June. 

 

 RESPONSE: 
29/06/2026 - Final response, information provided - within 

Permitted Development Rights. 
 



 PE\2026\ENQ\53739 EIR-  

1. Please can you send me the Site Plans for Newlands 
Farm and South View Farm 'pop up' campsites for this year 

(2026).  
2. Please confirm the outcome of your investigations into 

the various complaints you have received about both sites 
over the last few years 

 

See also PE\2025\ENQ\52896 
 

RESPONSE: 
28/04/2026 - Final response - information provided 

10 Apr 

2026 

28 Apr 2026 07 May 2026 YES NO 

 PE\2026\ENQ\53899 EIR: 
 

Received via WhatDoTheyKnow 
 

Under the Freedom of Information Act 2000, I kindly 
request information. 

1. What Built Environment (Planning, Building Control, and 

Land Charges) digital System does your council currently 
use? 

2.  Are there any known limitations or challenges within 
your current Built Environment System (eg usability, 

reporting, integrations, configurability), if so, what? 

3. When does the current contract for your Built 
Environment System expire? 

4. What is the total contract value of your current Built 
Environment system (including any extensions)? 

5. In light of the upcoming Local Government Re-
organisation, has the council undertaken (or does it plan to 

undertake) any review, consolidation, or replacement of 

systems used within Built Environment services? If so, 
please provide details of the scope, expected timelines, and 

whether this activity is anticipated to be delivered within 
the first 12 months of re-organisation or as part of a 

longer-term (e.g. 3-year) plan. 

18 May 
2026 

01 Jun 2026 12 Jun 2026 YES NO 



 

RESPONSE: 
01/06/2026 - Final response - information provided 
 

 PE\2026\ENQ\53705 EIR - I'm writing to request a copy of your Tree 

Preservation Order register under the Freedom of 
Information Act 2000. 

 
I'm looking for a digital, machine-readable dataset 

containing: TPO reference numbers, locations (as 

coordinates - either WGS84 lat/lng or Ordnance Survey grid 
references), species where recorded, tree type classification 

(individual tree, group, area, or woodland), addresses, and 
dates orders were made or confirmed. A GIS export such 

as Shapefile, GeoJSON, GeoPackage, KML, or CSV with 

coordinates would be ideal. 
 

If this data is already publicly available somewhere, a link 
would be very welcome - I'm just keen to make sure I'm 

working from the most up-to-date version possible. 
 

RESPONSE: 

17/04/2026 - Final response - refused under Reg 12(4)(d) 
material in the course of completion. 
 

02 Apr 

2026 

17 Apr 2026 01 May 2026 YES NO 

FOI Request        

 PE\2026\ENQ\53668 FOI - Please find attached a Freedom of Information 

request relating to your back-office systems for 

planning/building control and environmental services. I've 
tried to set it out in a questionnaire format to make it as 

easy as possible to work through. 
 

By way of background, I'm currently undertaking a piece of 
independent research into the planning technology 

landscape across England, Scotland and Wales  looking at 

24 Mar 

2026 

29 Apr 2026 07 May 2026 YES NO 



how local planning authorities are served by their current 

back-office systems, the contractual arrangements in place, 
and the extent to which the market is open to new entrants 

and innovation. It's a space that's getting a lot of attention 
at the moment with the government's digital planning 

programme and the broader push to speed up the planning 
system, and I think there's real value in building a clearer 

picture of where things stand. 

 
I appreciate that some of the questions touch on 

commercial arrangements, and I've included a note at the 
end of the request about exemptions and the public 

interest test. If anything is unclear or you'd like to discuss 

the scope before responding, I'm very happy to have a 
conversation. I'd much rather work with you to get a useful 

response than have the request refused on technicalities. 
 

If it would be helpful, I'm also available to speak with 
anyone in the planning or IT team who might be interested 

in the broader research. I'm hearing some fascinating 

things from councils across the country about the 
challenges and opportunities in this space, and I'm always 

happy to share what I'm learning. 
 

RESPONSE: 

17/04/2026 - initial response, completed questionnaire 
provided but reviewing contracts with NEC Legal team to 

identify elements/clauses that may be subject to 
exemptions, Section 43(2) and 41.  Requested extension of 

time until 07/05/2026 to provide full response. 
 

RESPONSE: 

29/04/2026 - Final response - some information withheld 
and some provided with redactions. Application of S43(2), 

and S40. 
 



 PE\2026\ENQ\53709 FOI - Under the Freedom of Information Act, I would like to 

request the following information for each calendar year 
from 2020 to 2026 inclusive: 

 
1. The number of cyber security breaches that have being 

identified that were found to be a result of a malicious 
threat actor (i.e. not accidental data breach) 

 

2. The breakdown in high-level causes of these breaches as 
identified by cyber security incident response teams 

(CSIRTs), for example (but not limited to) unpatched 
software/hardware, lack of multi-factor authentication 

(MFA), leaked user credentials, lack of in-transit encryption, 

etc 
 

3. The number of breaches that occurred that were 
attributed to a previously known vulnerability to the 

organisations hardware, software, policies, or processes, 
for example where system was known to be at risk due to 

being unpatched or out of support, or security controls 

were recommended but not enforced, and was defined 
within the resulting incident response report. 

 
4. The estimated combined costs incurred as a result of 

cyber security breaches defined in request number one in 

each year. 
 

No specific details are requested in relation to 
software/hardware utilisation, but rather high-level causes 

of breaches. I believe the high-level nature of this request 
does not allow for the use of s.31(1)(a) of the FOIA as this 

would not be likely to prejudice the security of your 

systems or data, as these are historical incidents which 
have since been dealt with. The public interest in 

understanding breach causes across public sector 
organisations outweighs the public interest in the 

07 Apr 

2026 

07 Apr 2026 05 May 2026 YES NO 



exemption. 

 
I would like you to provide the information in Word, Excel, 

or CSV format. 
 

RESPONSE: 
07/04/2026 - Final response - no incidents for time 

requested. 
 

 PE\2026\ENQ\54029 FOI - I would like to make a Freedom of Information 

Request to ask how funds from the parking fines are 
utilised within Derbyshire Dales. 

 
RESPONSE: 

23/06/2023 - Final response - information provided, 

funding not broken down into constituent districts, only 
figure is for whole of PDNPA. Spend on parking 

enforcement service, car park maintenance and visitor 
facilities maintenance. Sent link to car parking income for 

2025-2026. 

17 Jun 

2026 

23 Jun 2026 14 Jul 2026 YES NO 

 PE\2026\ENQ\53704 FOI - I am writing to request information which I believe to 

be held on your records and suitable for public release 
under the Freedom of Information Act 2000. 

 
Please could you forward a list of all holders of a firework 

licence/registration (Cat F1 - Cat F3) in your area of 

jurisdiction. 
 

If possible, please could you forward the list electronically 
to my email address, or alternatively, please send a hard 

copy to my postal address below. 
 

RESPONSE: 

02/04/2026 - acknowledgement and response - the 
authority does not deal with licencing or registration re 

fireworks, have provided links for constituent authorities. 

01 Apr 

2026 

02 Apr 2026 30 Apr 2026 YES NO 



 

 PE\2026\ENQ\53900 FOI - I would like to request information about motorcycle 

parking under the Freedom of Information Act 2000. 
 

Can you please supply data around the following, please 

note this is for council-owned or operated car parks only: 
  

 - Number of off-street parking spaces in total in the council 
area  

 

 - Number of those which are motorcycle specific parking 
spaces/bays/areas 

  
 - Number of motorcycles accommodated by the 

spaces/bays/areas listed above 

 
 - That data drilled down further by location (breakdown of 

spaces also listed by location (ie individual car park)) 
 

 - What the rules/charges are for motorcycles in the above 
area. Is it pay and display for motorcycles, or they're free, 

or whether they can park in car 

parking bays etc. 
  

Roughly a year ago, my colleague requested the same data 
from this council (and all others in the UK). So we are 

hoping to look at this data a year on to see if there have 

been any changes to motorcycle parking 
 

RESPONSE: 
10/06/2026 - Final response, information provided. 
 

21 May 

2026 

10 Jun 2026 17 Jun 2026 YES NO 

 PE\2026\ENQ\53770 FOI - Just been looking at your website, it's not very clear 

on info on your staff, chief exec salary, spending etc. 
Please could you send more info. 

 

20 Apr 

2026 

20 Apr 2026 15 May 2026 YES NO 



RESPONSE: 

20/04/2026 - acknowledgement and response sent with 
link to Open Government pages of website 

 PE\2026\ENQ\53683 FOI - I am writing to request information under the 

Freedom of Information Act (FOI) regarding incidents 
involving missing dogs within your covered area. 

 

To assist with a research project regarding hiker safety and 
pet welfare, please provide the following information for 

each of the last five calendar years (2021, 2022, 2023, 
2024, and 2025), broken down by year: 

 

Total number of incidents: The total number of reports 
received by your organisation regarding dogs reported 

missing or lost. 
 

Rescue operations: The number of times your staff or 
associated rescue teams were deployed specifically to assist 

in the recovery of a dog (e.g., cliff rescues, water 

recoveries). 
 

Outcome statistics: If recorded, the number of these 
incidents that resulted in: 

 

" Successful reunification 
" Injury or fatality to the animal 

" Injury to the owners/members of the public during search 
efforts 

 
Hotspot locations: A list of specific trails, peaks, or areas 

within your jurisdiction where these incidents most 

frequently occur. 
 

If it is not possible to provide the information requested 
due to the cost of compliance limits, please provide advice 

and assistance on how I can refine my request. 

26 Mar 

2026 

08 Apr 2026 24 Apr 2026 YES NO 



 

If a specific detail is not recorded, please fulfil the 
remainder of the request rather than dismissing it in its 

entirety. I would prefer to receive this information in an 
electronic format (Excel or CSV preferred). 

 
RESPONSE: 

08/04/2026 - Final response - information either not held or 

not recorded. 
 
 

 PE\2026\ENQ\53878 FOI -This is an information request relating to private 

health insurance for staff. Please provide me with the 
following information for the 2025-26 financial year:  

 

1. The total amount spent by your organisation on funding 
or subsidising private healthcare/medical insurance for your 

staff during the 2025-26 financial year. 
 

2. A summary or copy of the private healthcare 
policy/policies currently available to your staff. Please 

include details regarding the level of cover provided and 

the eligibility criteria for staff to access this benefit (e.g., 
whether it is available to all staff, or restricted to certain 

pay grades or roles). 
 

3. The total number of staff members who were enrolled in 

or successfully claimed from this private healthcare scheme 
during the 2025-26 financial year. 

  
If it is not possible to provide the information requested 

due to the information exceeding the cost of compliance 
limits identified in Section 12, please provide advice and 

assistance, under the Section 16 obligations of the Act, as 

to how I can refine my request. 
 

14 May 

2026 

15 May 

2026 

11 Jun 2026 YES NO 



If you have any queries please don't hesitate to contact me 

via email or phone and I will be very happy to clarify what I 
am asking for. 

 
RESPONSE: 

11/06/2026 -  the Authority does not provide or subsidise 
private healthcare and/or medical 

insurance for staff. 

 
 

 

 


